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Colin Baker owns a book store, and he’s back in Cedarwood with his son. He’s looking for a new start after a
bad breakup, but he never expected that start to include his old crush, Officer Jordan Hargrove. Jordan hasn’t
come out, but if he can score with Colin, then he’s all in. He’s dreamed of hot nights with the quiet man.

After a speeding ticket and some hurt feelings, sparks fly between the bookstore owner and the police
officer, but Cedarwood is a small town with small-town values, and a gay couple isn’t what the town
expects. Colin’s created a support group for single gay fathers and he feels he’s making some difference in
Cedarwood. Some folks in Cedarwood are fine with these two men reconnecting, but some aren’t.

Will the naysayers be enough to drive Colin and Jordan apart, or will they make their way together in this
small town?
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From reader reviews:

Mary Gale:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then
you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take Home to Cedarwood (Single Father Society Book 1) as your daily resource
information.

John Harris:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park. They
actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your current
free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The first
thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try out look for book, may
be the book untitled Home to Cedarwood (Single Father Society Book 1) can be very good book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

Lisa Yates:

The reason? Because this Home to Cedarwood (Single Father Society Book 1) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside.
Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content
inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for
you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
benefits than the other book have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking means.
So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Eulalia Perry:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet.
Every year was exactly added. This guide Home to Cedarwood (Single Father Society Book 1) was filled
with regards to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has different feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can experience enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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